
It Might Be TodaY 
"Cyborg" 

Each week we present what we call a Prophecy Update.  This is 
#439 in that series.

The Bible accurately foretells specific events - in precise detail - 
sometimes even centuries before they occur. 

Approximately 2500 prophecies appear in the pages of the Bible.  
About 2000, or 80%, have already been fulfilled to the letter, with 
no errors.

Because we know that the remaining 500 or so prophecies will 
definitely be fulfilled, we look for news, and trends, that you'd 
expect to be taking place. 

You might call them the signs of the times.

Two thousand years ago, the apostle John saw a future in which 
every citizen would have what he called a "mark" on their hand or 
forehead by which they would be identified, and by which they 
would transact all of their daily business.

We have reported on many technologies that sound eerily like 
they could become the fulfillment of that prophecy.

One we haven't reported on, which may be the creepiest of all, is 
humans becoming cyborgs.
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Don't immediately flash to The Terminator, or some other ScFi 
representation.  Cyborg is short for cybernetic organism.  It 
applies to a person with any type of mechanical enhancement.  

If you have a pacemaker, you are considered a cyborg.

The future for cyborgs is a lot more than pacemakers.  Among the 
advances being made,  scientists are finding ways to connect 
your brain to a computer.

A June 2015 article was titled, Neural lace has been invented to 
organically connect your brain with a computer.

Excerpts:

Scientists from China and the US have found a pioneering way to 
inject a tiny electronic mesh sensor into the brain that fully 
integrates with cerebral matter and enables computers to monitor 
brain activity.

Researchers from Harvard and the National Center for 
Nanoscience and Technology in Beijing have succeeded in 
inventing a flexible electrical circuit that fits inside a 0.1mm-
diameter glass syringe in a water-based solution.

When injected into the brains of mice, the mesh unfurled to 30 
times its size and mouse brain cells grew around the mesh, 
forming connections with the wires in the flexible mesh circuit. 

The biochemical mouse brain completely accepted the 
mechanical component and integrated with it without any damage 
being caused to the mouse.
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http://www.ibtimes.co.uk/neural-lace-has-been-invented-organically-connect-your-brain-
computer-1506481

The authors said this about the advances being made:

[It marks] the beginning of the true human cyborgs... humans that 
have electronic parts in them... as well as the concept of humans 
having brains that can instantly tap into infinite knowledge, such 
as the plot in the Scarlett Johansson film Lucy.

A January 2016 article was titled, US military aims to create 
cyborgs by connecting humans to computers.

Excerpts:

US military’s Defense Advanced Research Projects Agency 
(Darpa) has unveiled a research program called Neural 
Engineering System Design (NESD) which aims to develop an 
implantable neural interface, connecting humans directly to 
computers.

At the moment, human-computer interfaces connect a large 
number of neurons at a time - somewhere between 100 and 
1,000 - to a machine. Darpa aims to refine the technology so as to 
connect individual neurons.  This would give much finer control, 
reduce noise and, in theory, speed up communications between a 
human and a computer.

https://www.theguardian.com/technology/2016/jan/20/us-military-cyborg-connecting-humans-computers

You would be automatically, wirelessly, connected to computers.  
It goes way beyond buying and selling, but that would certainly be 
part of the interface.
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Human cyborgs also fulfill the prophecy of Daniel, that in the last 
days knowledge would increase exponentially.  I don't know if you 
caught it or not, but one of the articles mentioned that we would 
be able to "instantly tap into infinite knowledge."

While we look for signs of the times, there is one event that has 
no sign.  It is presented as being imminent - meaning, it could 
occur at any moment.  

Jesus will come and resurrect the dead believers, than snatch-
away those who are alive.  We call this the Rapture of the church.  

Are you ready for the rapture?  If not, get ready, stay ready, and 
keep looking up.  Ready or not, Jesus is coming!
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